Tuesday, May 11, 2021

The Penn Township Board of Supervisors having notified the residents in advance met on May 11, 2021, at noon at the Penn Township Municipal Building, 157 East Airport Road, Butler, PA 16002 with the Chairman, Samuel M. Ward, presiding.  Also present was Supervisor, Douglas A. Roth.  Supervisor Wilbert J. Mowry, Jr. was absent, and Township Manager, Linda D. Zerfoss.  Three visitors were present.

The purpose of the meeting was to open bids for the 2021 Paving and Sealing projects. 
 
2021 Seal Coat Project
	COMPANY
	APPROX QUANTITY
	DESCRIPTION
	BID BOND
	UNIT PRICE
	TOTAL
	GRAND TOTAL

	SHIELDS
	21,447S.Y
	SINGLE ASPHALT SEAL COAT
	N/A
	NO BID
	NO BID
	N/A

	SHIELDS
	27,188S.Y.
	DOUBLE ASPHALT SEAL COAT
	N/A
	NO BID
	NO BID
	N/A

	SUIT-KOTE
	21,447S.Y.
	SINGLE ASPHALT SEAL COAT
	YES
	1.68
	$36,030.96
	

	SUIT-KOTE
	27,188S.Y.
	DOUBLE ASPHALT SEAL COAT
	YES
	2.83
	$76,942.04
	$11,973.00

	RUSSELL STD
	21,447S.Y
	SINGLE ASPHALT SEAL COAT
	YES
	1.277
	$27,387.82
	

	RUSSELL STD
	27,188S.Y.
	DOUBLE ASPHALT SEAL COAT
	YES
	2.477
	$67,344.68
	$94,732.50

	SHARON PAVING
	21,447 S.Y.
	SINGLE ASPHALT SEAL COAT
	N/A
	NO BID
	N/A
	N/A

	SHARON PAVING
	27,188 S.Y.
	DOUBLE ASPHALT SEAL COAT
	N/A
	NO BID
	N/A
	N/A

	YOUNGBLOOD
	21,447 S.Y.
	SINGLE ASPHALT SEAL COAT
	YES
	1.18
	$25,307.46
	

	YOUNGBLOOD
	27,188 S.Y.
	DOUBLE ASPHALT SEAL COAT
	YES
	2.18
	$59,269.84
	$84,577.30



2021 Paving Project
	COMPANY
	APPROX QUANTITY
	DESCRIPTION
	BID BOND
	UNIT PRICE
	TOTAL
	GRAND TOTAL

	Wiest
	3,313 Tn
	Asphalt Binder
	Yes
	60.45
	$200,270.85
	

	Wiest
	545 Tn
	Asphalt Wearing
	Yes
	60.45
	$32,945.25
	

	Wiest
	337 Tn
	Asphalt,Forward Twp
	Yes
	60.45
	$20,371.65
	$253,587.275

	Shields
	3,313 Tn
	Asphalt Binder
	Yes
	60.07
	$199,011.91
	

	Shields
	545 Tn
	Asphalt Wearing
	Yes
	60.07
	$32,738.15
	

	Shields
	337 Tn
	Asphalt Wearing
Twp
	Yes
	60.07
	$20,243.59
	$251,993.65

	Sharon Paving
	3,313 Tn
	Asphalt Binder
	N/A
	No Bid
	No Bid
	N/A

	Sharon Paving
	545 Tn
	Asphalt Wearing
	N/A
	No Bid
	No Bid
	N/A

	Sharon Paving
	337 Tn
	Asphalt Forward Twp
	N/A
	No Bid
	No Bid
	N/A


	Youngblood
	3,313 Tn
	Asphalt Binder
	Yes
	72.34
	239,662.42
	 

	Youngblood
	545 Tn
	Asphalt Wearing
	Yes
	96.78
	52,745.10
	N/A

	Youngblood
	337 Tn
	Asphalt Forward Twp
	Yes
	72.34
	24,378.58
	$316,786.10




After the bids were read and recorded, Supervisor Ward stated that Penn Township would review the bids and take action at the Penn Township Board of Supervisors’ meeting scheduled later that day.

Supervisor Ward made the motion and Supervisor Roth seconded the motion that the meeting be adjourned.

The meeting adjourned at approximately 12:10 p.m.
Approved:					Respectfully Submitted:

________________________		___________________________
Samuel M. Ward				Linda D. Zerfoss
Chairman					Township Manager
Board of Supervisors			Penn Township

